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About the designated centre 

 

The following information has been submitted by the registered provider and 
describes the service they provide. 
 
Group A Community Residential Service provides full time residential services to 
thirteen service users, and part time residential services to two service users. These 
services are provided in three community houses in Limerick. The designated centre 
provides services to individuals with mild and moderate levels of intellectual 
disability. The aim of the designated centre is to improve the quality of life of 
residents through a person centred approach, ensuring they are encouraged, 
supported and facilitated to live as normal a life as possible in their local community. 
The three community houses are two-storey semi-detached houses, with front and 
back gardens. Each house is staffed by social care leaders and social care workers. 
There is one staff on duty in each house when residents are present. Staff members 
work sleepover duty in each house at night. 
 
 
The following information outlines some additional data on this centre. 
 

 
 
 
  

Number of residents on the 

date of inspection: 

9 
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How we inspect 

 

This inspection was carried out to assess compliance with the Health Act 2007 (as 
amended), the Health Act 2007 (Care and Support of Residents in Designated 
Centres for Persons (Children and Adults) with Disabilities) Regulations 2013, and the 
Health Act 2007 (Registration of Designated Centres for Persons (Children and Adults 
with Disabilities) Regulations 2013 - 2015 as amended. To prepare for this inspection 
the inspector of social services (hereafter referred to as inspectors) reviewed all 
information about this centre. This included any previous inspection findings, 
registration information, information submitted by the provider or person in charge 
and other unsolicited information since the last inspection.  
 

As part of our inspection, where possible, we: 

 

 speak with residents and the people who visit them to find out their 

experience of the service,  

 talk with staff and management to find out how they plan, deliver and monitor 

the care and support  services that are provided to people who live in the 

centre, 

 observe practice and daily life to see if it reflects what people tell us,  

 review documents to see if appropriate records are kept and that they reflect 

practice and what people tell us. 

 

In order to summarise our inspection findings and to describe how well a service is 

doing, we group and report on the regulations under two dimensions of: 

 

1. Capacity and capability of the service: 

This section describes the leadership and management of the centre and how 

effective it is in ensuring that a good quality and safe service is being provided. It 

outlines how people who work in the centre are recruited and trained and whether 

there are appropriate systems and processes in place to underpin the safe delivery 

and oversight of the service.  

 

2. Quality and safety of the service:  

This section describes the care and support people receive and if it was of a good 

quality and ensured people were safe. It includes information about the care and 

supports available for people and the environment in which they live.  

 

A full list of all regulations and the dimension they are reported under can be seen in 

Appendix 1. 
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This inspection was carried out during the following times:  
 

Date Times of 

Inspection 

Inspector Role 

Thursday 19 
August 2021 

09:30hrs to 
17:00hrs 

Cora McCarthy Lead 
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What residents told us and what inspectors observed 

 

 

 

 

Overall, the inspector found that the residents in this centre were supported to 
enjoy a very good quality of life and to have meaningful relationships in their local 
community. The inspector observed that the residents were consulted in the running 
of the centre and played an active role in decision-making within the centre. 

On the day of inspection the inspector had the opportunity to meet with all 9 
residents who resided in the centre. Conversations with residents took place wearing 
the appropriate personal protective equipment (PPE) and was time-limited in line 
with national guidance. 

Residents had regular contact with family members and during the health pandemic 
were supported to keep in contact with their family on a regular basis, this was 
primarily through video and telephone calls. The Person in Charge advised that 
family contact has been very good for the residents and residents who have family 
contact have received emails, phone calls, photos, used Skype, etc to parents or 
siblings. When restrictions eased, face to face visits were supported for families and 
residents. 

One resident remained at home on the day of inspection and chatted to the 
inspector several times, the inspector met all other residents on return from day 
service. The residents were very pleasant and welcoming and gave the inspector a 
tour of their home which they were very proud of. One resident was happy to show 
the inspector their bedroom and it was decorated in the design of the residents 
choice. The residents bedroom had a fairy garden and the staff had supported the 
resident in purchasing items and fairy stickers which the resident had decorated the 
bedroom with. It was evident from the decoration, personal items on display and 
the resident bedrooms that the residents were involved in the running and 
decoration of their home. 

The inspectors spoke with both residents on the day and found them to be very 
comfortable and happy in the centre. They spoke fondly of staff and said that they 
were kind to them. They were active on zoom during the pandemic, engaging in 
chats with family and friends which residents said they enjoyed. Residents told staff 
that they enjoyed regular walks with staff and also went to day service. Some 
residents had set up their own business making and selling items such as 
homemade cards and crafts. Two residents were actively saving for a trip to Boston 
to see family members as soon as it was safe to travel, they were very excited and 
looking forward to this trip. One resident had made beautiful artwork and another 
was baking brown bread to sell at the market. When the inspector spoke to the 
residents they told the inspector about the positive relationship they had with the 
person in charge and staff members. The resident said that the staff were very good 
to them. 

Residents were encouraged and supported around active decision-making and social 
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inclusion. Residents participated in weekly residents' meetings where household 
tasks, activities and other matters were discussed and decisions made. Residents 
were informed about COVID 19, restrictions, testing and vaccination processes and 
given the opportunity to consent. 

The inspector observed that, overall, the residents' rights were being upheld in this 
centre. Where appropriate, informed consent and decisions relating to the residents 
were made in consultation with the residents’ family members. The inspector saw 
that consent forms, and decision-making assessments were included in residents' 
personal plans. 

The centre was warm, clean and comfortable. Each resident had their own bedroom 
and had decorated it to their taste, with personal belongings and photographs etc. 
The residents said they felt safe and happy in their home. 

In summary, the inspector found that each resident’s well being and welfare was 
maintained to a very good standard and that there was a visible person-centred 
culture within the designated centre. 

The next two sections of the report present the findings of this inspection in relation 
to the governance and management arrangements in place in the centre and how 
these arrangements impacted on the quality and safety of the service being 
delivered to each resident living in the centre. 

 
 

Capacity and capability 

 

 

 

 

Governance and management systems in place at this centre ensured that care and 
support provided to the residents was to a very good standard, was safe and 
appropriate to their assessed needs. There was a clearly defined management 
structure, which identified the lines of authority and accountability for all areas of 
service provision. The person in charge held the necessary skills and qualifications to 
carry out the role and was both knowledgeable about the residents assessed needs 
and the day-to-day management of the centre. The person in charge had ensured 
all the requested documentation was available for the inspector to review during the 
inspection. 

The provider had ensured that staff numbers and skill mix at the centre were in line 
with the assessed needs of the resident and with the statement of purpose. The 
inspector reviewed the actual and planned rota which indicated continuity of care 
from a core team of staff known to the residents. Currently the staffing levels in the 
centre were adequate however it was recognised by the provider that residents 
needs were changing and increasing and they were reviewing the staffing numbers. 
The person in charge demonstrated the relevant experience in management and 
was effective in the role. The staff members with whom the inspector spoke with 
were very knowledgeable around the residents assessed needs. For example they 
were very aware of the residents diagnosis of a rare skin disorder and the 
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medication to treat this condition. 

The person in charge had a training matrix for review and the inspector noted that 
there were some gaps in mandatory training in relation to the management of 
behaviours that challenge. However the person in charge committed to addressing 
the gaps in training the day after the inspection as the staff in question were new. It 
was confirmed via email that this training was completed the following day. There 
was also significant training completed by staff in relation to protection against 
infection such as Hand Hygiene Training and Infection prevention control training. 
Discussions with staff indicated that staff were supported to access mandatory 
training in line with the provider's policies and procedures in areas such as 
safeguarding, manual handling, positive behaviour management and fire safety. 

Clear management structures and lines of accountability were in place. The provider 
had also undertaken unannounced inspections of the service in 2021 and 2020 and 
a review of the quality and safety of service was also carried out in Oct 2020. 
However this audit did not include family views, the annual review did state that the 
staff had offered support to families throughout the pandemic but it did not show 
that the provider had sought the views and opinions of the family members. The 
annual report did review staffing, quality and safety, safeguarding and a review of 
adverse events or incidents. In areas highlighted for improvements it was noted that 
the service Director of Nursing had commenced a review prior to the pandemic and 
the Service Manager has a plan to progress the need for enhanced supernumerary 
time for PICs in 2020/2021. This would ensure the PIC would have greater oversight 
and monitoring of the centre in terms of training and development. Also some staff 
continue to require refresher training in mandatory courses that were affected by 
the COVID pandemic. These audits resulted in action plans being developed for 
quality improvement and actions identified had been completed or are actively being 
addressed. 

There was an effective complaints procedure in place in an accessible format. It was 
noted that complaints were mostly resolved locally and were resolved to the 
satisfaction of the complainant. There were no open complaints at the time of 
inspection. 

The registered provider had a written statement of purpose in place for the centre, 
which contained all information required under Schedule 1 of the regulations. 

Contracts of care were in place for the residents which included support, care and 
welfare of the resident and the fees to be charged. 

During the inspection incidents were reviewed and it was noted that the person in 
charge had notified the Chief Inspector of incidents that occurred in the designated 
centre. 

 
 

Regulation 14: Persons in charge 
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The person in charge demonstrated the relevant experience in management and 
was effective in the role. 

  
 

Judgment: Compliant 
 

Regulation 15: Staffing 

 

 

 
The person in charge had an actual and planned rota which was in line with the 
statement of purpose. 

  
 

Judgment: Compliant 

 

Regulation 16: Training and staff development 

 

 

 
The person in charge had a training matrix for review and the inspector noted that 
there were some gaps in mandatory training. However the person in charge 
committed to addressing these gaps in the coming days. 

  
 

Judgment: Substantially compliant 
 

Regulation 23: Governance and management 

 

 

 
The provider had ensured clear management structures and lines of accountability 
were in place. However for the purpose of the annual review the provider had not 
consulted with resident representatives or sought their views. 

  
 

Judgment: Substantially compliant 

 

Regulation 24: Admissions and contract for the provision of services 

 

 

 
Contracts of care were in place for the residents which included support, care and 
welfare of the resident and the fees to be charged. 

  
 

Judgment: Compliant 
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Regulation 3: Statement of purpose 

 

 

 
The registered provider had a written statement of purpose in place for the centre, 
which contained all information required under Schedule 1 of the regulations. 

  
 

Judgment: Compliant 

 

Regulation 31: Notification of incidents 

 

 

 
The person in charge notified the Chief Inspector of incidents that occurred in the 
designated centre. 

  
 

Judgment: Compliant 

 

Regulation 34: Complaints procedure 

 

 

 
The provider had an effective complaints procedure for residents in place which was 
accessible. 

  
 

Judgment: Compliant 
 

Quality and safety 

 

 

 

 

The inspector reviewed the quality and safety of care received by the the residents 
in the centre and found it to be of a very good standard. The inspector noted that 
the provider had implemented the necessary protocols and guidelines in relation to 
good infection prevention and control to ensure the safety of all residents during the 
COVID-19 pandemic. These guidelines were in line with the national public health 
guidelines and were reviewed regularly with information and protocols updated as 
necessary. 

The person in charge had ensured that a comprehensive assessment of need of 
health, personal and social care needs had been completed for all residents. This 
included support plans to supplement this assessment of need. The inspector 
viewed support plans in areas of mental health and medical diagnosis such as 
Dariers skin condition. These plans were noted by the inspector to clearly identify 
the issues experienced by the residents and how a resident may present in crisis or 
ill health and gave clear guidance to staff on how to respond in such situations. The 
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support plan for Dariers condition was comprehensive and included cause, 
symptoms and a treatment plan created by the the clinical nurse specialist, staff and 
consultant. There was also a detailed document regarding the high alert medication 
used to treat the skin condition. This highlighted that the resident required to have 
bloods taken quarterly to monitor kidney and liver function, the possible side effects 
of the medication and the stringent monitoring around the medication and storage 
of same. Staff spoken with acknowledged that these support plans were effective 
and demonstrated a good understanding of the strategies to employ when 
addressing different situations. 

In relation to regulation 6 Health care the registered provider demonstrated that 
appropriate health care reviews were taking place and the required health care 
support was received by residents. An example of a health care support plan noted 
by the inspectors was in relation to hypertension experienced by one resident. A 
plan of care was in place which outlined symptoms, and treatments, this was 
developed by the staff nurse specialising in this area. This provided guidance to staff 
on how to support the resident with this health care issue to maintain the health of 
the resident. 

A comprehensive behaviour support plan was noted to be in place by the inspector. 
This included an in depth functional analysis of the residents behaviour thus 
identifying the behaviour and making every effort to alleviate the cause of this 
behaviour. Staff demonstrated knowledge of how to support residents to manage 
their behaviour and were very familiar with the needs of the residents and the 
behaviour support strategies that were in place. 

As part of the person centred planning process the person in charge had outlined 
goals that had been decided upon with the resident, there were progress notes 
written up regularly and the goals were specific to the resident and achievable. 
Some of these goals related to arts and crafts the residents were making and selling 
at markets. 

The person in charge had ensured that the residents were assisted and supported to 
communicate in accordance with their needs and abilities. The residents had access 
to television and Internet and a electronic device was available to facilitate the 
residents to video call their family members during the COVID - 19 restrictions. The 
residents relationships and contact with peers was through regular zoom chats. 

The provider ensured that the residents received appropriate care and support in 
accordance with assessed needs and their wishes. The residents were active in their 
community. They utilised local shops, local amenities such as parks, went for walks 
and drives. On the day of inspection residents were at day service. They also utilised 
the Internet and zoom, one resident was saving for a planned trip to Boston to visit 
family members. 

The provider had a risk management policy in place and all identified risks had a risk 
management plan in place including the risks attached to COVID-19. The provider 
ensured that there was a system in place in the centre for responding to 
emergencies.The provider had ensured that residents who may be at risk of an 
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infection such as COVID-19 were protected by adopting procedures consistent with 
the standards for infection prevention and control. PPE in the form of face masks 
were introduced as mandatory for all staff to wear. All training in enhanced hand 
hygiene and Infection Prevention Control (IPC) were completed. Supplies of alcohol 
based Hand Sanitizers/ soap and paper towels, posters for hand hygiene and cough 
etiquette in place. Easy read versions were developed to aid residents understanding 
and compliance also. Standard Operating Procedures were created in line with 
national IPC guidance to support staff manage if a resident or staff is suspected or 
confirmed as having COVID-19. 

Previously there was a restrictive condition in place around fire however on this 
inspection the inspector noted that all work required in relation to fire had been 
completed. The person in charge had ensured that all fire equipment was 
maintained and that there was emergency lighting and an L1 fire alarm system in 
place. The inspector reviewed evacuation drills which were carried out regularly and 
found that they indicated that the residents could be safely evacuated in 30 
seconds. No issues were highlighted as part of the evacuation drill. Personal egress 
plans were in place for the residents. Fire doors were in place since the last 
inspection and the automatic magnetic closers were placed on doors. 

The provider had ensured that the premises were laid out to meet the needs of the 
resident and overall the centre was clean and warm. There was adequate communal 
and private space for residents. The centre was decorated to the residents personal 
taste. 

The inspector observed that there were systems and measures in operation in the 
centre to protect the residents from possible abuse. Staff were facilitated with 
training in the safeguarding of vulnerable persons. The inspector spoke with the 
person in charge regarding safeguarding of residents. They were able to clearly 
outline the process of recording and reporting safeguarding concerns. 

The provider had ensured that the residents had the freedom to exercise choice and 
control in their daily life and consent was sought from the residents for example for 
the COVID - 19 and flu vaccine. 

 
 

Regulation 10: Communication 

 

 

 
The provider had ensured that the residents were fully supported to communicate in 
accordance with their needs. 

  
 

Judgment: Compliant 
 

Regulation 13: General welfare and development 

 

 

 



 
Page 12 of 18 

 

The provider ensured that the resident received appropriate care and support in 
accordance with assessed needs and their wishes. 

  
 

Judgment: Compliant 
 

Regulation 17: Premises 

 

 

 
The provider had ensured that the premises were laid out to meet the needs of the 
residents. 

  
 

Judgment: Compliant 

 

Regulation 26: Risk management procedures 

 

 

 
The provider had a risk management policy in place and all identified risks had a risk 
management plan in place including the risks attached to COVID-19. The provider 
ensured that there was a system in place in the centre for responding to 
emergencies. 

  
 

Judgment: Compliant 

 

Regulation 27: Protection against infection 

 

 

 
The provider had ensured that residents who may be at risk of an infection such as 
COVID-19 were protected by adopting procedures consistent with the standards for 
infection prevention and control. 

  
 

Judgment: Compliant 
 

Regulation 28: Fire precautions 

 

 

 
The provider had ensured that there was an effective fire management system in 
place 

  
 

Judgment: Compliant 
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Regulation 5: Individual assessment and personal plan 

 

 

 
The person in charge had ensured that a comprehensive assessment of need of 
health, personal and social care needs had been completed for all residents. 

  
 

Judgment: Compliant 

 

Regulation 6: Health care 

 

 

 
Overall the health and well-being of the resident was promoted in the centre. 

  
 

Judgment: Compliant 

 

Regulation 7: Positive behavioural support 

 

 

 
A comprehensive behaviour support plan was noted to be in place by the inspectors. 
Staff demonstrated knowledge of how to support residents to manage their 
behaviour and were very familiar with the needs of the residents and the behaviour 
support strategies that were in place. 

  
 

Judgment: Compliant 
 

Regulation 8: Protection 

 

 

 
The inspector observed that there were systems and measures in operation in the 
centre to protect the residents from possible abuse. Staff were facilitated with 
training in the safeguarding of vulnerable persons. 

  
 

Judgment: Compliant 
 

Regulation 9: Residents' rights 

 

 

 
The provider had ensured that the residents rights were respected and that they 
exercised choice and control in their daily lives. 
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Judgment: Compliant 
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Appendix 1 - Full list of regulations considered under each dimension 
 
This inspection was carried out to assess compliance with the Health Act 2007 (as 
amended), the Health Act 2007 (Care and Support of Residents in Designated 
Centres for Persons (Children and Adults) with Disabilities) Regulations 2013, and the 
Health Act 2007 (Registration of Designated Centres for Persons (Children and Adults 
with Disabilities) Regulations 2013 - 2015 as amended and the regulations 
considered on this inspection were:   
 

 Regulation Title Judgment 

Capacity and capability  

Regulation 14: Persons in charge Compliant 

Regulation 15: Staffing Compliant 

Regulation 16: Training and staff development Substantially 
compliant 

Regulation 23: Governance and management Substantially 
compliant 

Regulation 24: Admissions and contract for the provision of 
services 

Compliant 

Regulation 3: Statement of purpose Compliant 

Regulation 31: Notification of incidents Compliant 

Regulation 34: Complaints procedure Compliant 

Quality and safety  

Regulation 10: Communication Compliant 

Regulation 13: General welfare and development Compliant 

Regulation 17: Premises Compliant 

Regulation 26: Risk management procedures Compliant 

Regulation 27: Protection against infection Compliant 

Regulation 28: Fire precautions Compliant 

Regulation 5: Individual assessment and personal plan Compliant 

Regulation 6: Health care Compliant 

Regulation 7: Positive behavioural support Compliant 

Regulation 8: Protection Compliant 

Regulation 9: Residents' rights Compliant 
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Compliance Plan for Community Residential 
Service Limerick Group A OSV-0003939  
 
Inspection ID: MON-0033844 

 
Date of inspection: 19/08/2021    
 
Introduction and instruction  
This document sets out the regulations where it has been assessed that the provider 
or person in charge are not compliant with the Health Act 2007 (Care and Support of 
Residents in Designated Centres for Persons (Children And Adults) With Disabilities) 
Regulations 2013, Health Act 2007 (Registration of Designated Centres for Persons 
(Children and Adults with Disabilities) Regulations 2013 and the National Standards 
for Residential Services for Children and Adults with Disabilities. 
 
This document is divided into two sections: 
 
Section 1 is the compliance plan. It outlines which regulations the provider or person 
in charge must take action on to comply. In this section the provider or person in 
charge must consider the overall regulation when responding and not just the 
individual non compliances as listed section 2. 
 
 
Section 2 is the list of all regulations where it has been assessed the provider or 
person in charge is not compliant. Each regulation is risk assessed as to the impact 
of the non-compliance on the safety, health and welfare of residents using the 
service. 
 
A finding of: 
 

 Substantially compliant - A judgment of substantially compliant means that 
the provider or person in charge has generally met the requirements of the 
regulation but some action is required to be fully compliant. This finding will 
have a risk rating of yellow which is low risk.  
 

 Not compliant - A judgment of not compliant means the provider or person 
in charge has not complied with a regulation and considerable action is 
required to come into compliance. Continued non-compliance or where the 
non-compliance poses a significant risk to the safety, health and welfare of 
residents using the service will be risk rated red (high risk) and the inspector 
have identified the date by which the provider must comply. Where the non-
compliance does not pose a risk to the safety, health and welfare of residents 
using the service it is risk rated orange (moderate risk) and the provider must 
take action within a reasonable timeframe to come into compliance.  
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Section 1 
 
The provider and or the person in charge is required to set out what action they 
have taken or intend to take to comply with the regulation  in order to bring the 
centre back into compliance. The plan should be SMART in nature. Specific to that 
regulation, Measurable so that they can monitor progress, Achievable and Realistic, 
and Time bound. The response must consider the details and risk rating of each 
regulation set out in section 2 when making the response. It is the provider’s 
responsibility to ensure they implement the actions within the timeframe.  
 
 
Compliance plan provider’s response: 
 
 

 Regulation Heading Judgment 
 

Regulation 16: Training and staff 
development 
 

Substantially Compliant 

Outline how you are going to come into compliance with Regulation 16: Training and 
staff development: 
The PIC will ensure that all mandatory staff training will be in date as required. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Regulation 23: Governance and 
management 
 

Substantially Compliant 

Outline how you are going to come into compliance with Regulation 23: Governance and 
management: 
The registered provider will ensure that the views and opinions of families are sought as 
part of the annual review of quality and safety. 
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Section 2:  
 
Regulations to be complied with 
 
The provider or person in charge must consider the details and risk rating of the 
following regulations when completing the compliance plan in section 1. Where a 
regulation has been risk rated red (high risk) the inspector has set out the date by 
which the provider or person in charge must comply. Where a regulation has been 
risk rated yellow (low risk) or orange (moderate risk) the provider must include a 
date (DD Month YY) of when they will be compliant.  
 
The registered provider or person in charge has failed to comply with the following 
regulation(s). 
 
 

 Regulation Regulatory 
requirement 

Judgment Risk 
rating 

Date to be 
complied with 

Regulation 
16(1)(a) 

The person in 
charge shall 
ensure that staff 
have access to 
appropriate 
training, including 
refresher training, 
as part of a 
continuous 
professional 
development 
programme. 

Substantially 
Compliant 

Yellow 
 

18/11/2021 

Regulation 
23(1)(e) 

The registered 
provider shall 
ensure that the 
review referred to 
in subparagraph 
(d) shall provide 
for consultation 
with residents and 
their 
representatives. 

Substantially 
Compliant 

Yellow 
 

05/10/2021 

 
 


